gt A, et
T .

e

¥

e

fet s o o g r——
- i 3

XHfear-—255
©

UEFEG '-To 1?6 @)eﬁ 4

ITT s'asﬁa 'ﬁx%ﬁ’ a'm" wtfm

- amam

| f&’g‘ﬁﬁ’ vfefase

I 1 —TE (F)
(ST g3w wiafmn)

i

i

==

TGS, HIAAR, 25 AIT, 71978
| qUE@ 5, 1900 TF AT _

IGT 939 TR
fagrfaT seTT-

ae 1128fqag-fa0~1-<18-197¢

#GAH, 25 WA, 1978

faize :
AR &1 AReT F wqsIT 200 & AW GeANF AEEW A IWI NiIw faum qosa

. BT onid 9% nEm AT (wﬁaw) fedaw, 197892 fevim 24 witw, 1978 0w zala

97T F WX ag IaT AEw wfafaw

deal o, 1978 ® TIH gFWMURT 1 g g afuge
e wEtima e wa‘ra |

SR 3w wamry (dwiga) wfafrmw, 1978
[eere s sffrgs dear 9, 1978]

(Sa1fis IR faur wvew grar oifea gan) |
HYSF wr mrasrdr afufram, 1910 1 ATAT FNET FG £ fag

iy #fafran
T Tt & IeAvwd av § fesafafe s afefae g war §-— 7
1-—a% afafran 3oz 92w wasrd (FwrgT) afafam, 1978 Ha7 o o

2~-awaam7¢mmﬁufaﬁm 1910 =Y, ford omi wa wiafmm g7 1w §,

L

gfereg am

dqva 15 wiy-
‘mnﬁqw(‘i)ﬁ?mf"mml B

fazm  H=a7 4,
1910 &Y gry
3 ¥ gmew




qrer 11 57
sfaeqred

g7 20 &1
OIS

g 22 W7
qwaT
g 23 FT
g

TE W 28-F
_ T FEET AT

2

3——§ﬁqﬁﬁwﬁm‘<‘r 11 % & o3 freafafas amr v € s, aaigi——

“11==(1) mmﬁuﬁwwmﬁﬂf’aﬂm&(aﬁm AT
T §), @ afufean $ ofw guwy srtarfel & swaw
ofrer mmfrm*ﬁmamwa‘mxﬁtsq arufagn.& sfte
gl FARET AT q& 77 AEHTA G0 et 7} ey it & foem
afid, TS qFT 30 &% e gwm qf fawgt g

fafga Of &, amEHTd wrgEa 1 # 97 g0 ¢

mwaﬁﬁmmmmﬁma@q@ﬁ s, 93 as
fs ga =ufas safag v, Q@ AEw Hqie T oW & s Y Aa fea & Wi
Seqd 7 Foray o, s ww @ 5 aewat &, ooy, w=, @, i ar
o+q 207 5, sz & &), e v N =9 ¥ w9 25 siawg wvofr F
qETT FT GEAGTAT TG TG T F L@y e

wee SR 73 & s ardter sTferral 3% fad st Tt el ¥y
afafafas fra 1@, #3, @9, wifd T w7 07 ) G Frarewes ofr
% gvaen § qiadl  sfaeramns gve Y wqee B s ar frfee s
GET -

 (2) TS ETER AT R wESon ¥ ar R srfag syfer gra W e
FUT I3, Wq&ﬁm*ﬂaﬁwﬁﬁmquﬁam&eﬁ oy § dafux
i #Y et OF ST B [EaT, @A I AN a1 T s & v
ﬁnﬁm%mwmmmmfmmm%ﬁtm qdyert
5T goar g, A afz fFE Ared § oo R R 9 adw & 6 oy sdw ar
wraTgr 71 afcega, frefe, saem o @i & g @ S s =ifE
a’ra:iammmaqﬁ"r%

sfiramy 7% & f 50 a70 % e FREY GRS 9% aRimd ST 2re AT
ﬁm@ﬁmmﬁﬁ%@mmmmuﬁﬁwamt
azfemmmn gl

Wmv%%ﬁﬁwewm$m&ﬁéwmwﬁ%mmam
T F fF 9% WAHTQ AAG F AW Y A9 G F s e s aw
o B mr wfver et 7g AT &Y, EWT A XA W gy ST ST A
gra famer A & et gt e

sfraeg ag #Y § 5 grdeT & fad 1§ araaw ggw gt e sam
% aF (% graas 1, aqrfeafy #3, &g, oifeq, ar geg 4% &, sfz a1
g1, fagrageg Tiw €1 F9 ¥ F7 25 srfa'sra gaufo £ zrarmfr FT G-
oa% gag wega T w5 fza g .

sfasra ag ot & s T GIF1L 37 FI F, s afwfafaa fmg Sien]
FT, Erq, wifea a1 w7 290 F fEe) faamae afn 3 geaew § qfadf i
FFATERF GUF Ft AT AHT F1 wiacwy v fnfys sTamdr g

4—3 wfafes &Y a7 20 §, I (2) frwrer <F sy o

s——va gfafagn #Y arw 22 7 (foad gawr aned wivg® ot afeafag ) wee

“ergaeg 797 wigt W W & wrd Y, % T 9% weg “amvy a9 1@ fag SEFd

g——w @ wiafags #1 a7 23 4, ma?fmaw’:tmm(x) #, msz gEEg
a§”, wgt ¢t N F = i, F 9 G weR gAEw qw” < fag A1 |

757 sfafean # arar 28 % qvarq favafafas ar agr & araR AT g gT &
a-gnﬂﬂﬁ%mﬁwﬁ Tiq— :
“28F-—(1) G'Ef et gamedt @1, wEwrd foam § @ afesrd e
oy fardr srreT W 3@ fafra sfaga 8 oltgw s 9w -
wfaa ; T § fewE a1 faae w1 OF T T 9 § watig gfom -
afafe WE A i qrar v, Sgt AT G whs afem a3 e 28
qes 1 & s Fraffe aramg 209 SSIE qoF $1 &9art gk

ey P A s aan

i bt 2ot s o oean




3

(2) st a& adieror o< fosre a1 fagz ot oo s @8 § wafoa ofarm
® FHF 9T A AT ag FA (FArae T F 9T , GAF A T7 ST iTRar &
FI gE g1 1 90 77 & fru s Aaw § aeq A e § <awq & gl
I &1 T 37 F o ot § et ) 7@ whaorw Y w2 & afusg) e, 77
TEFRTL gFT ¢ wfawa § ofgs F aE FAY F qEA TR IR AEE A

#rma%q*ﬂ?ﬁmaawnfaf‘ﬁ# TG MEF FT TPET IR

qeF T ATHTO g & wfafiag svar o

: 8——q mrfufras 7 a1y 49 F - - _
: ' ()wm()qm%q?mq?srm“rafm .
- g AT <@ fad s, o

(@') YT (2) A, WeR OR uF ‘gve giHAT fgan, 1898 F ey
14”%=mWmﬁaTtﬁﬁ"mgmerﬁgm,1973%mm12"r@feﬁ
ST

9——AF saf T FT g S3H ITUIA (1) A wexw A F srsm"r CIEE IR
o W owe 9e rdew w fad Ao

E T

10-—97 gfafaam &1 q17 54 §,-—

(7) wez AT HF "qo7 g7%ar AT, 1898” # €A qT weg AL HF
‘gz wtwgy d@fgar, 1973”7 @ fag s,

(@) sfaaseas gwsd, v X oF ‘97 62 4T 657 FEAT

T WeT HITHT G 62, AT 64-F 4T 91 657 <T@ faf qrdl |

11——Wuﬁrﬁmrafram 55 & o g7 faeafufas am @ T W,
T -

"55——4TRT 60 W ITART (2) HIW 62 HIX G 64F &  Ha
a‘f%mwa;rtrrrs: SUSHTH-TRTT T, J0F IERAT HiZAT, 1973 & mataty

e Y ]

USTHTAGT §F . ASTAHET g |

1289 slatTan S g 60 F 207 07 freafafae g wr“rmmﬁ
R —

Y60——(1) Wl =T gw afafraw @1 T wE M S aF fed
wag s, e, fram ar fe od feft snde &1 97 969 aef W
afeaen, fraty, wssm,  FRet are@a, TXHE 9T 99 FT IoUT FT-—
fagr wrfz & fad
wifer

(=) m%ﬁmf‘w‘rm%m FT werﬁrq’fam af g, w3
T ITH] A FoA H TEAT E, AT

(@) wi (F3fag dzrgar) #7 @ &% 8, 0

(¥) win (Fafaw Jergar) & & AT 9w =1 dwg a1 fam rﬁma
taa w18 w1es Fusr fafua far o7 gwvat &, o

(1) &#E srTaraely, Tavat o gremvaady Fafag wea § a1 e g, o

() Tl ST T F1E GTH, SHT, 6, HL ?JT IUF arET

fre frell Wi &g & frmior & ford o 738 &2 § a7 wrod wmmﬁ
H T@ar g, @

(7) = =fufraw § a7 agde g, sfm o T 5 s,
mﬁﬁamﬁmmmaaﬁimaﬁmam

(6) FFasfod et raa T A § avg HTaT &, 97
(=) qi sm‘q‘aﬁwasrmﬁmtr%sﬁ AET a5 awﬁmaz: LI
g .
(=) m42$aaﬁaﬂfw=§ﬁaaﬁ‘tqmsﬁqmm qa‘rﬁa‘ra argr
memﬁﬁmma,

?"

T 49 FT
gomrea
. uTT 53 A
T

g 54 &
HIIIT

I §5 ®
9T
U FT FfH-
T

g1 60 ®
47T 9T F4T
U & A0F-
FHTYA




arl 61 &I
dqraT

g 62 F
gq7 9T A%
gra =1 &fa-
1qq

g1 83 &I
goaA

grvT 64 F
o 9T 7%
gro &1 gfd-
St

7€ G1U 6 4-F
T FE74T
qTAT

4

I FTUATE F1 08 fagy sraqr a1 & a8 qF §) gHa7 § A wdge fHar
T A gre (@) & wfF grem W feafy F @@ gemz gew @ gAufw
Y, afz @t wrEs TR & g0 § 3@ afafEe g 595 Fofva aArd a7 faaat
AT o 7F AR F ALAT AT THG AN, qreq ATHA, IR 77 N0F F ALA
wua@ FY W Gy sawaur"m gift, FzWAA A FWA Frw AR Pray wer
feafa % 0¥ eTT2-qeF F1 UCW & =@ 7 71 90T A w4 ¥, N A 7w @,
w7 T

(2)s £ ga wfafraw o1 9% gdtw aq0q aF {5t fraw o 23 a3
qiaw ar g8 wfafqge & zdtT i fedEr qrgd@a, gUi@ez grem F1 IFHE9
w7& foE Ares aeq &1 faia wieqr @, a1 el w2@ &1 wrava, fqafa ar 7ieaga
®TAT § 71 IEF! 497 59 § W@AT 2 IX FIUATE _H1, N @: 4G § FA AL v
AT Y @19 aF aF gy FFAT , 0T f‘mr WM S nd-gow Y fzar qrawr A
ZT AT FIT § A AL GIAOT AT Y Q7T FATT ®RIF GF g 70§ o

13— sfafaaw @ a1 61 7 (faew suwr qed wids oY afeafaa 3),
u= “HEEITg Sgl FE! W ATAT &Y, B I G qR AR @ ZAT FIET

14—77 wfafmaw ' @U 62 3 @w ) foafafas arw wa‘ramn‘t.

qqi]—

" 6 2—ft Y foreft QY fowrz 1, m%agmqﬁrﬁﬁgi@ a1 7Er, At
farafime st fra gl ™ g, AT STWR & TG IETET § 97 FAH AT
HME ITAM F TN RGT § ATFA § F 15 Q91 fapa foae @ & @ Awa
o1 g & JIHRT & 1T J90 T g1 a7 faed graey § 99 5w arw
fad mfew . T F1 &0 g fer 79 g, 99 O9Y waty & 49 9 5.

oTE § w9 ALY gri A1 S AT 79 J% g1 awdr &, ®Tard
T gug foqr I 1T g wdqwe § A wiw gAC WT awE gFATE,
FUGHIT ZIT 1
ETRFT—TH 91 & AT ag Ay St s 5w ez e
AR ® ag anfaa gt ard s $F9 et aran § facs aax 2, frge fewe 2
s faga fege faam § av ag faga feme G ageam g 1
15—~ sfafas 1 21 63 7, 722 517 A" % e O g ow Al AR
neg "uF BT & € 9T weg orw gend’ 1@ fay amEe
16— Hfufmaw F 417 64 F w17 9 Fraforfaa ara w@ & sy, aalq-
"6 4——Y 715 58 wiafaaw & g7 fog 78 frdt wrgdq, a<fue a1 918
ATEERYTA AT FTUTF §1d U AT QY UTCF & Y197 9 218 g¢, 41T
IE% J9% @10 '-aaa”rw“rﬂrmmgq-—
wfaqa st &
fer anrfie
(%) fFEY Sr@sd qigsrd g1 afw 919 93 a1 Feer O o3 safaq
. T A W 9%, S 39 9 90H & {9 a9s w9 § afgga gy, aan
Argde, T 41 I 5T & T &, a9
(w) wredEm, vxfue a1 qrq 9 5t wal 1 Seawa w8 amgE FX
%1% QET & a1 F4-A1T @7 § 9% avay § 39 qfa{1aq 7 g=aar
g A Gl, a1 .
(7) o wwe fows fad a1a 60 # guarg 2, @ faq el ams &
g1 40 F W I 77 7Y fTaR 7 A1 FL IeATA FET G,
'S4 Wi 09 A9y & A7 A99-3ve, W ST AT §IF TF I gRAI G, (247
s 1
17—~ WAt FY g0 64 F 99 Freiaaa arr 337 &1 A, Aqig——-

“s4~$—(1)\'zﬁ #1559 wifufram § sl fret 7es asg & (o ar
S % {8 18T a<F g9 §T,AT OF a1 & FarEraa
ﬁﬁﬁqmmt qaﬁagqmamfﬁ?amﬁfﬁamaﬂqﬁé gifa- -
o afay T A0 1 € s e R swst areafaman ar
EE squ;: mﬁwmmmmmﬁmwa‘r ar 59 ufy-
:Tﬁa ® faga & el @ 13 fodt fraw gra fifsg #1§ qard
faemar § a1 faend &1 wqar qT M € &d Qar faspor

Wit 398 §fgal & 9ra 272 @ ®WUvT AQ9fANO & WIOg &7 Sifc




-5

L #aarar g, I8 FIOTE F1 3 S B AW § FF T WAL 417 39 aF 2
. A HAEve o, S 0 AR W9 ¥ A A @ W A &Y g as

o (2) 1w g wfafee © gdw Fedt aes aeg 2 frska o fawdo 8
©o - R ATRERET 1 gT T OF 9TF & JawieT § g gu el e waw
o ek R F wmamw Yar o feww w3 w1 wmor & B g 3 woe
- g, faxut nvm R e fawa W R @ fawwd @dr an el Far
8 98 T AR dF Al oF g awar 2, ;T WA TS WY &g

T % g a%ar g, e s : :

- sfowre ag § fF ave Freafafaa & 500 @n—

C () v o § far fE A w1 sraar w8 4 w14l ar

o A a7 1 595 w7 9% awg |7 S
18— gl g 69%%“%%‘%@3'}?@,%%:—

*69—afz F1% ufeq oI 60, TIRT 62, TIT 63T ART 65 F FFT T
: @y Rifg 3 IF g & Eqaﬁa‘fﬁ i 99 73 gRg-gwg 93 4,
& af ve T PRl wraw % ferd age fog Qv agad am e
EARLS . ® AT T ATt 7 § R ata & weftr quee sy
FeaT AR fag < agwan owTE, Mg 9w aw ¥ gEm aw Ak A
- woft grm St g wfafraw & #dw oget Swfafz o srofee T a7

sfcraewr ag § FF 911 60 F1 ST (1), a1 91 63 9T AT 65 F THW
faditm av sepaei wwww & @ Sw-fafe 97 fafa F o afmsw 39w
7 wE A Ay AT w1 T ST R e 60 # gy ( 2)
AT AR 62 F WA faediw A1 A g & R gvfafe 4 feafa & od -
TvE afgd 79 & 9 ¢F a9 a7 Hafyr & @ F7 202 faay se

. e e g & F g AT A 16 A Pt 9 s 2 il i o
. T g9 AT AT, 1973 & WA 21 R AW gwd dR 9w R
fear o s ), o9 wAR faur Rl oW & T A e

19— wfafram 7t a7 69F H,—

(%) s7aTw (1) %, 72 wRoF 4T 60 Rave (@), @we (1), Gis
(%), @ () areve (F) a7 arxr 62" % I T W=7 AT 7F At 60
T (1) F @ (F), @vs(w), @ (2) arave (o) avgvar (2)

Coar AT 62" fad S ' ‘ :
(@) wwarw (2) 5% “1898 §0” F e T TF “1973” .
i :

L2 ~ st F 91T 70F, 5997 (1) &, wve (F) #, wsx sk 5w
YT 63" % T X W, HF AR MR AT 63, OTU 64F" @ fad it |

& “rig (—i= wfafas 7 a1 715 & 9% frefafas oo @ Q st sraf -

oo 71W—2wE SRR AT, 1973 W 41T 306 WR 308 F Sywem el
Lo |ar iz & sfafew @ M T qwas F Feaew T 3@

. wdfa Sveew m.ﬁﬂaﬁfwm%m#@mﬁmms
L wfafEm . @ d i ol e Aam g g . '

(&) 'm.iﬁiﬁnmﬁa?ﬁma‘f% fat & W@ wEOa®

q1% 69 ®
Ty 9T ad
g wr qfa-.
A

U 69-F
FT AT

a 70 w1
gmaa

"I 715 R
WM 9T qg
qra F xfy-
I




e SR HEET ToE 25, 1978

[——————

o=

afyfaas g&31

02— Wit T 74%wq—<ﬁrmfafaamﬁwa'mﬂ=ﬁ, ST
“74-(1) 18 sraFr siferFTd o T frfirer s qCETL @ falle &9
goTE 3 wwea faT T &, ﬁwﬁﬁ%wﬁﬁ%ﬁmﬁmﬁﬂ,qﬁz

LG mmmu%mﬁmmmﬁwﬁﬁaﬁm
@mmﬁmﬁmﬁm@%wﬁm 64 a7 OTT 68 &F SHIT
¥y forga A frea # gea ¥ a1 fd T

2) & aafir gy, awfeafiy, G gl & e @ A F LI
A safaq M ﬁmﬁ@gmﬂﬁmmmqﬁ-

(%) aﬁsrmﬁaﬁﬁiﬂq‘(mm%ﬂm griaer fFd @@ &1
o &, gfe wed gu ffaa Apew AR WA
o ewa & WA, o ifem 7 fafafese fram 9, Y AT

(@)
ﬁﬁaWﬁumﬁaﬂﬁmW~mR%ﬁmw@;

F favg

HiT

() e & GRS gﬁaﬁma&&mm@n
(3) # et forg T ATaTY (1) 2 gy wifes /TR H1 TG @
ﬁfaﬁw%mﬁwﬂm%mﬁwﬁmﬁw gfwafaa ag e
w1 g |
2 3=—9TT ﬁ.‘-‘srmaw'rﬁ(daﬁuﬂ) (gﬁ-zﬂ'ﬁlﬁﬂﬂﬁﬂ’r{ Fifvwor) wfafaam,’
1976 B T 2 & s AT §, R AT A e wRT TS (FwE ) wfat,
1972”%mumsﬁtw"m RS (&) mfafmw, 1972 @
i‘aﬁmﬁﬁsﬂz-t{éﬁft@wﬁaﬁm

24—1{amﬁmmmwa[aFm’rmfafaﬁfmma‘.gﬁgqﬁ,mm
wgaamsasrfaﬁmwﬁmr% a‘f‘mqﬁwwm%wﬁ%mﬁm 28—%
# S g sl g AN ﬁmﬁé,faﬁﬁﬁaﬁ.ﬁwa =
m\ﬁaﬁﬁm@,a@aﬁ@mmﬁ%ﬁmmﬁaﬁﬂﬁmm,mm 28-F
3 srene fafereae AT < “orfafeaR SeTE YFF At ST A 39 WE{RAR D
Iqare TE1 FTO e T A9 4 | ‘

25--(1) SWT A TS (GHE) WOTRT 1978 W I N2
vl (fadva i) qemiw, 1978 gaagwr fafed for w9 §

(2) T e F g gt STETd (1) ¥ frfess fimt somawr @1
mdﬂﬁa{aﬁaﬁmqfﬁmﬁﬂﬁﬂﬁm fardt gw mfafaw g
aa wataa g« A T T SUEE] % e T 4 q7 Frdargy a9E
FREAY WAL swr’r‘srmaﬁ:ﬂmmﬁ groq@ &R TS T

: AT ¥,
WA TR 79 WA,
‘gfag




THE UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1978

(U:. P. Acr no. © oF 1978)

[¢Authoritative English text of the Uttar Pradesh Abkari (Sanshodhan)
PR Adhiniyam, 1978]

' AN
ACT
further to amend the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910

IT 15 HEREBY enacted in the Twenty-ninth Year of the Republic of India
" ds follows :— ' '

1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment)
Act, 1978

"2 In section 3 of thé United Provinces Excise Act, 1910, hereinafter
referred to as the principal Act, clause (5) shall be omitted.

3. For section 11 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely :—

“ll. (1) The Collector, and every other Excise Officer (not being the
R Excise Commissioner) shall, in respect of all proceedings
fe%ggglfs 20d ynder this Act, be subject to the conwol of the Excise
’ Commissioner and all orders passed by Collector or such
other officer under this Act, shall be appealable to the Excise Commis-
stoner in the manner prescribed by rules made by the State Govern.
ment in this behalf :
' Provided that no appeal shall be entertained under this sub-section unless
it is preferred by the aggrieved person within thirty days from the date of com-
. munication of such order, and unless the appellant has furnished satisfactory
. proof of having paid a sum of not less than 25 per cent of the disputed amount of
- tax, fee, penalty or other dues, if any, as the case may be :

'+ Provided further that the appellate authority may, for spedail and adequate
. Yeasons to be recorded in writing, waive or relax the requirements of the pre-
ceding proviso in respect of such disputed amount of tax, fees, penalty or other
 dues, . :
(2) The State Government may either suo motu or on an application by
. an aggrieved person call for and examine the records relating to any order
passed in any proceedings under this Act, for the purposes of satisfying itself as
16 the correctness, legality or propriety of any such orders or as to the regulariry
of si¢h proceedings ; and, if in any case it appears to the State Government that
such order or proceedings should be modified, annulled, reversed or remitted
.. fof reconsideration, it may pass orders accordingly :

f Provided that no order adversely affecting any party shall be passed under
' this section unless he has been given a reasonable opportunity of making his
representation :

i, Provided further that no application under this sub-section shall be enter-

. tained unless it is preferred within thirty days from the date of the order of the
Exasé Commissioner and unless an appeal, where it lies, has been filed and
 disposed of by the Excise Commissioner ; .

- Provided also that no application for revision shall be entertained unless
the applicant has furnished satisfactory proof of having paid a sum of not less
than 25 per cent of the disputed amount of tax, fee, penalty or other dues. if
21y as the case may be :
T _-—-_-*._-— 0
., (FOr Statemant of Objects and Reasons, please see Uttur Pradesh Gazetre Extragrditary,
dated Apri] 5, 1978.) '

: (Passed in Hindi by the Ultar Pradesh Lepisiative Acsembly on April 7, 1978 and by

the Uttar Pradesh Lepislative Council on April 19, 1978.) ) .

" Reccived the assent of the Gavernor,. on April 24, 1978 under Article 200, of the

Constitutinn of India and w#s published jn part 1 (&) of the Legislative Supplement of the
. Unar Pradest; Gazete Extraordinary dated A-ril 25, 1978. .

Tt

Short title,

Ameéndment of

stction 3

of

U. P, Act IV

of 1910,

Substitution of

stction

11,




7]

2

~ Provided also that the State Government may, for reasons, to be recorded
in writing, waive, or relax the requirements of the preceding proviso in respect
of such disputed amount of tax, iees, penalty or other dues.”

Séﬁgg%‘g_em ot 4 In section 20 of the principal Act, sub-section (2) shall be omitted.
Amendment of 5. In section 22 of the principal Act, including the marginal heading

sectjon 22, tuereof for the words “eighteen years” wherever they occur the words ‘‘twentys
one years” shall be substituted.

Amendment of 6. In section 23 of the principal Act, in the marginal heading and in
section 23. sub-section (1) for the words “eighteen years” wherever they occur the words
“twenty-one years” shall be substituted.

Insertion of new . 7. After section 28 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
section 28-A.. inserted and be deemed always to have been inserted, namely :— )

“98-A. (1) Where the quantity of spirit or beer in stock in a brewery
Imposition of 18 found, on examination by such officer of the Excise
additional dyty Department as may be authorised by the Excise Com-
in certain cases.  missioner in this behalf to exceed the quantity in

hand as shown in the stock account, the brewery shall be liable to pay duty
on such excess at the ordinary rates fixed under section 28.

(2) Where the quantity of spirit or beer is found less than that shown

in the stock account on such examination and deficiency exceeds ten

. per cent (allowance to that extent being made to cover losses due to
’ evaporation, sullage and other -contingencies within the brewery, and
also to cover loss in bottling and storage) , the Excise Commissioner shall

levy an additional duty at the rate of one hundred per cent of ordinary

rates of duty in respect of such deficit as exceeds ten per cent over and

above the ordinary rates of duty.”

Amendment of 3. In section 49 of the principal Act—
section 49. (a) in sulrsection (1), for the words "“an Officer-incharge of a Police

Station” the words “Sub-Inspector” shall be substituted ; ‘

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words and figures “Chapter XIV of the
Code of Criminal Procedure, 1898" the words and figures “Chapter XI1
of the Code of Criminal Procedhre, 1975 shall be substituted.

In section 33 of the principal Act, in sab-section (1), for the words “an

Amendment of 9.
section 53. Officer in-charge of a Police Station” the words “Sub-Inspector” shall be
substituted,

10, 1In section 54 of the principal Act.—
(a) for the words and figures “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1898" the
words and figures “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1975” shall be substituted;

(b) in the proviso, for the words and figures “section 62 or section 657
the words and fgures vsection 62, section 64-A or section 657 shall be

subst;’tuted.
Sub stitution of 11. For section b5 of the principal Act, the following section shall

new section for substituted, namely :—
section 35,

Amendment o f
section 54.

be

section 62 and section 64-A, shall be non-bailable within

Certain offences e
riminal Procedure, 19737

1N b;‘ nen- the meaning of the Code of C
tlabie,
Substitutjon aof 12, [For scction 50 of the pr

new section for cubstituted, namely :—
section €0. “60, (1) Whoever, in contravention of this Act or of any rule or order
made thercunder, or of any licence, permit or pass

obtained thereunder :—

incipal Act. the following section shall be

pepalty  1of
unlawful import,
export, trans-
port, manufacture,
possession,  sale
cte.
(¢) imports, €xports,
than charas ; oOT
(b) cultivates any hemp plant, (cannabio sakivay; or

{ransports OF pOssesses amy intoxicant other |

“55. All offences punishable under sub-section (2) of section 60,




3

() collects or sells any portion of the hemp plant (cannabis
sativa) from which any intoxicating drug ecan be manufactured ; or

(d) constructs or works any distillery, brewery or vintnery; or
{¢) uses, keeps or has in his possession any material, still, utensil,
implement or apparatus, whatsoever, for the purpose of manufacturing
any intoxicant other than tari ; or
(f) removes any intoxicant from any distillery, brewery, vintnery
or warchouse licensed, established or continued under this Act ; or
(8) bottles any liquor for the purposes of sale; or
(%) sells any intoxicant, save in the case provided for by section 61 ;
or
(:) taps, or draws tari, from any teri-producing tree in the areas
_ notified under section 42;
shall be punished with imprisonment which may extend to two years
and with fine which shall, in the case of an offence under clause (i) not
be less than ten times the amount of duty which would have been levi-
able if such intoxicant had been dealt with in accordance with this Act
and the rules and orders made thereunder or in accordance with any
licence, permit or pass obtained thereunder, and in any other case, not
be less than ten times the amount of such duty, or five hundred rupees.
whichever is greater.

(2) Whoever in contravention of this Act or any rule or order made
thereunder or of any licence, permit or pass, obtained under this Act,
manufactures any intoxicant or imports, exports, transports or possesses
any charas, shall be punished with imprisonment which shall not be
less than six months and which may extend to three years and also with
fine which shall not be less than two thousand rupees and which may
extend to five thousand rupees.” ‘

s

12, Insection 61 (including the marginal heading thereof) of the principal Ameéndment of
-Act, for the word “eighteen” wherever it occurs, the word “twenty-one™ shall pe Section 61.
| substituted.

14. For section 62 of the principal Act, the following section shall be Substitition of
‘ new stction for

. substituted, namely :— section  62.
Gt 62, Whoever renders or attempts to render fit for human consump-
Penalty forrep- tion any spirit, whether manufactured in India or not,
dering dematured  which has been denatured, or has in his possession any _
s Cglt:lsun.l?; denatured spirit which has been rendered fit for human
tion. consumption or in respect of which any attempt has been
made to render it so fit shall be punished with imprisonment for a term
which shall not be less than six months and which may extend to three
years, and shall also be liable to fine which may extend to five thousand
L. rapees.
?37 Explanation—For the purposes of this section, it shall be presumed
"' that any spirit which is proved to contain any quantity of any denaturant,
is, or contains or has been derived from denatured spirit.”

15, In section 63 of the principal Act, for the words “three months” the A enement of
words “one year” and for the words “one thousand” the words “five thousand” Section 63.
shall he substituted.

16, For section 64 of the principal Act, the {ollowing section shall be Eggsgﬁl&’: fgf

Sabers
Substituted, namely :— section 64,

“64. Whoever, being the holder of a licence, permit or pass granted
Penalty of cer. under this Act, or being in the emplov of such holder

tain acis by licen- . .
see or his servapt, 12d acting on his behalf—

(a) fails to produce such licence, permit or pass on the demand of
any Excise Officer or of any other person duly empowered - to make
such demand ; or '

(b) wilfully does or omits to do, anything in breach of any of the
conditions of the licence, permit or pass, not otherwise provided for
in this Act ; or ) ‘

- : -




[osartion of new
section 64-A,,

Substitution of
now section for
section 69.

Anrcndment of
saction #9-A.

Amendment of
section 70.

4
(¢) save in a case provided for by section 60, wilfully contravenes .

any rule made under section 49, ' o
shall for each such offence, be punished with fine which may extend
to two thousand rupees.” :

17.  dfter section 64 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
inseried, namely 1 —

“64-A. (1) Whoever, being the holder of a licence for the sale or-
Popalty for  manufacture of any intoxicant under this Act or a persems :
adulteration etc.  in the employ of such holder, mixes or permits to be mixed .
ggg;"n';‘fﬂ:gg;dor with the intoxicant sold or manufactured by him any:

" mnoxious drug or any foreign ingredient likely to add to its ;
actual or apparént intoxicating quality or strength, or any article prohi-’
bited by any rule made under this Act, when such mixture does not amount
to an offence of adulteration under section 272 of the Indian Penal Cede,
shall be punished with imprisonment for a term which shall not be less j
than six months and which may extend to three years and also with fine |
which shall not be less than ene thousand rupees and which may extend:|
to two thousand rupees.

(2) Whoever, being the holder of a licence for the sale or manufacture:|

of any intoxicant under this Act, or a person in the employ of such holder
sells or keeps or exposes for sale, as foreign liquor, liquor which he:
knows or has reason to believe to be country liquor, shall be punished with;
imprisonment for a term which may extend to three years and with fine.|
which may extend to two thousand rupees: ¥

Provided that the punishment shall not be less than— | i
(i) imprisohment for tiree months and fine of two hundred rupees:

for the first offence, and 3!
(ii). imprisonment for six months and fine of five hundred ru

for each of the second and subsequent offences.” il

I8. For section 69 of the principal Act, the following section shall bé;
substituted, namely :— i

“§9, . If any person, after having been previously convicted of an offence |

. punishable under section 60, section 62, section 63 or,
mﬂcﬁgfﬁdpgg;?g; sectioni 65 or under the provisions of those sections as they |
conviction. stood from time to time subsequently commits and is con-j
victed of an offence punishable under any of these sections;

he shall be liable to twice the punishment which may be imposed on a first
conviction under this Act : -

Provided that in the case of conviction for a second or subsequent offencer
under sub-section (1) of section 60, section 63 or section 65 a sentence of impri:|
sonment for a term of not less than three months, with fine, and in the case}
of conviction for a second or subsequent offence under sub-section (2} of section 3}f
or section 62 a sentence of imprisonment for a term of not less than one ye

with fine, shall be passed :

Provided further that nothing in this section shall prevent any offence that|
might otherwise have been tried summarily under Chapter XXI of the Gode of}
Criminal Procedure, 1975 from being so tried.” 8
19. In section 69-A of the principal Act,— T

g) in subsection (1), for the words and figures “clause ( by, clause (c): :'
clause (€) , clause (f), or clause (k) of section 60, or section 62 the wordi
and figures “clause (b), clause (d), clause () or clause(g) of sub-sec
ton (1) or of subsection (2) of section 60 or of section 627 shall be|

substituted ; j
(b) in sub-section (2), for the figures “1898" the figures ‘1973” shail b
substituted. 3

90, In section 70 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), in clause (a)'f
for the word and figures “section 63", the words, figures and letter “section 63

section 64-A,” shall be substituted. _ {




oo

5

L]

©+ 21 For section 71-A of the principal Act, the following section shall be
jubstituted,” namely :— =

“71-A. 'The provisions of sections 306 and 308 of the Code of Criminal

Provisions regar-  Procedure, 1973 shall apply in relation to offences puni-

. ding apagdﬂﬂ, SIC.  shable under this Act as they apply in relation to offences
o?fencemsl? y upder Mentioned in section 306 of the said Code.”

the Act. - |

22. For section 74 of the principal Act, the following sections' shall be
swbstituted, namely :—

“74. (1) Any Excise Officer specially empowered by the State Govern-
Compounding of ~ Me€Nt in that behalf may accept from’ any person whose
offences, licence, permit or pass is liable to be cancelled or suspended
under section 34 or who is reasonably suspected of having
committed an offence punishable under section 64 or section 68, a sum of
money not exceeding five thousand rupees in lieu of such cancellation or
suspension or by way of composition for the offence which may have been
committed, as the case may be, and in all cases in which any property has
been seized as liable to confiscation under this Act, may release the same
on payment of the value thereof (as estimated by such officer) .

(2) On the payment by such person of such sum of money or such
value or both, as the case may be, such person, if in custody, shall be set
at liberty, and all the property seized may be released and no proceeding
shall be instituted or continued against such person in any criminal court.
The acceptance of such sum of money by way of composition shall be
deemed to amount to an acquittal and in no case shall any further
proceedings be taken against such person or property with reerence to the

same act.
74-A. (1). If a holder of a licence, permit or pass granted under this
Imposition of Act or an employee of such holder contravenes any of the
penality. conditions of the licence, permit or pass or any rule made

under this Act, any Excise Officer authorised by the State Government in
this behalf may impose 2 penalty not exceeding five thousand rupees.

Coe
(2) No order imposing 2 penalty shall be made under sub-section (1)
unless the holder of the licence, permit or pass or the employee con-
cerned is given—
(a) a notice in wWriting informing him of the grounds on which it is
propased to proceed under this section ;
(b) areasonable opportunity of making a representation in writing,
within such time as may be specified in the notice, against such
grounds; and

{¢) a reasonable opportunity of being heard in the matter,
(3) No person on whom a penalty is imposed under sub-section (1)
shall be liable to prosecution in respect of any offence under this Act on
the same facts.” :

23. In section 2 of the:Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) (Re-enact-

ment and Validation) Act, 1976, in the opening sentence, for the words and
figures «gue 3w wawr, ("WeT ) AfEfTIE, 1972 the words and

- figures «IIT iy gyarsw (Fuaw) oEfraw 19727 shall be substituted and

be deemed always to have heen substituted.

24 Notwithstanding anything contained in the principal Act or any

. other law for the time being inforce, any levy imposed by the Excise Commis

. sioner, before the commencement of this Act, in respect of deficit quantity at the

Tate not exceeding the rate specified in section 28-A, as inserted in the principal

Act by this Act, whether described as ‘fine’ or by any other name, shall be

. 1deemed to be ‘Additional duty’ validly imposed under the said section 28-A,
" as if the provisions of this Act, were in force at all material times,

Sukbstitution of
new section for
section 71-A.

Substitution of
new Section for
section 74,

Amendment of

section 2 of
U. P. Act no. §
of 1976,

Validation,




S

" T YRW 58 UTTI wgT 25 %Aw, 1978

(1) The Uttar Pradesh  Excise (Amendment) . Ordinance, 1978 and v F )

(Second Amendment) Ordinance, 1978 are hereby 0'“';'“’5‘”9 X

1976

Repeal a0d 25. ' 1
tavings the Uttar Pradesh Excise

repealed. .

(2) “Notwithstanding such appeai, anything done or any action taken 10-"-5.
under the principal Act as amended by any of the Ordinances reflerred to in no. 6
sub-section (1), shall be deemed 10 have been done or taken under the corres- y8.
ponding provisions of the principal Act as amended by this Act, as if the provi- <
sions of this Act were in force at all material times. _

W

By Order,
R.-C, DEO SHARMA,
' . Sachiv. -

rovwog oo~y ofio 34 s10 (B0} 25 ¢~78—1978 =700 {25 0)1




	00000001
	00000002
	00000003
	00000004
	00000005
	00000006
	00000007
	00000008
	00000009
	00000010
	00000011
	00000012

