
!kart steersa 
ITTzu 

(39-K sthr WifErfrrif 

ci(ci 1th , #T1747K)  25 5C1iq,1-1978 

;kilt]  5, 1900 VrW timck 

3WT Stilk7 :r7WTK 

fctui filch! sgTTTITH 

74741 	 -18-197 

9ig73, 25 wiem, 1978 

fElfirti 
IITTKff EFT 81;7417' i IXTeiC 200 ie tZETIR' 117044TF Arc-4 	3FT givr NEM RuIq 

. grt1 taftff z•vrzit WEITTT.1 (MAIM) flaitTIT., 1978 tit &I 	hp 24 ggiFf, 1978 t 0 WI 7.1;r1-6 

	

sir9- 	so? a 397 Wit ‘TIETMVIT #8111 9, 1978 	WR8101t11117 tef irdATif Wff ;ArtiFM 
STriliT6 ftrez11 q'Tal 

K.1 1-1 t9T wircitia (4viTE79-) 	-1q=r, I 978 
gar91:17 #eXT 9, 19781 

(iffrIF9.9-csrker fqtrirr u‘ff 	crtfcdprT) 
TillEfa.  gra. motbra 9eurnoi, 1910 Fr m ci 	t ThMIT9' 	 

719197TIT 
iTro. Tr [1.1%N 3741ticT ati iffreafg 	c'Er 14141 
1--2r 'Alf-4717 UM; Tklif 7.4Phia (tithEfq) 	rfftrTip  1 978 91T Qi 1q111 I 	itraCff 9.71 

2--EfFd VIrd 174M-ret infuftm, 1910 0, fq.# 5Wrif r grfainTi gT inft 	tiVfff srtu 

	

tITTI 3 	rpm (5) fettr,r fit mitir ! 	 • 	rffulT thlti7 4, 
1910 er EITTT 

3 wr aflkm. 

/tvt46tri-i-255 

(a) 
ti,it ceti Vo 

WTT7771  gTh7, U97 eljTk7 
ii 
	

39T STil-TizT 	 Va5TaTff 

WWITT7 



2 

TIM 110 
sff91:4144 

t. 

3—Tiff 81rNr1d 	Eft 11*FIT7 47 fierr 	.EIRT 712* nig& gerc-•••3 

" 1 1— ( 1) 	 t w 4 mlttlft wrftrere. (w) 9,4131,00 VIIIM 
qy t), 	uctrfwEr4 * 	FrErer  	irrERa 

	

92417 11.17   9417:4TF frRicluf if 011 9t7 WTI ITRTF11114 mM 
74-twit 	tc:icrd.< Err 4 wEr tifipniaark-r f44 44 Firm gra-1/ff* faw 

9;r41.F, TrErs <cm, 	 4713? 9* 11991 810 
faro tria.  4, $4 [4<niirpre, 	 Frit : 

)rfeeir Er4 f-+ ct:r tiltitcr* wryftff *114141,44Tir we et wain., qa tq 
ff 	ogliitr 0,41-40 	ffr $41;q 4‘faff 	A-ri*fcrtig, 4 ciliT f4-4 	41.fft 
srfr fThqt 714, 07 77 ffT 	34,11,not k, tuffErfa., 	erir, iftcl 41 
3:174k0tttt t, fag ivAtcr tirxi 0 Wg 	0T 25 7%74 U-77Tf7 Ti* 
quer *73.kt-1(3,41ml 077 43717 07 fat t : 

(Wit srfa-479.  ErWTwflt 	i1uCt gkfkT'T iffit 14 	cr +-Ruff t 
	tsra.  f*Er 	 77, *1, mikct Err wrar ;tiff et •r-er fqclIciitCf urn 

ffnrytt tria-41 mrc161,t4 	73-4 er %tiff 	ciicEPfff Err fark9.  
t 

( 2)‘97-Ery 	<tit 111 	tvir /11frt Mika' *LI =to U77 013174491 
T-7* 	VT 9;rfErf-erEr *9;rer4 fwttrn WI.  titavr  
OR*" fcttit 	trrksr 	1, 4tia-r Err tiricEr Err Wr wr4.4-r@ 
Iiqflwii 4; FITWEEr 4 wre 991714 T7i*f711 Pft4T kiTh-th 	Th 700 47tall 

u*th t, 9;f17 Erf411,41.  ITT* Tirgr Fc+-R Er-E 	q-1 te irrbr  
wrzi•Trert Tr-es-t-ff,rty4Iscr,,nielrEfT 717717 * Mir r: itfEra.  T7-91 4tfet 
th 9.pr 	togr4.qr kiericit : 

1fra-0711.  zit 	EIRT ge9" febt11.  44017 47 uf7T:7513117 4179' 410 
017*31 7-4)'f'441 vittoif 74 77 f7 7.?r711171,91-91ki 04 0 ifit99719,1147-  

kf4Err ErErr th : 

3ER1RT*7311-10-1441;q4310 70'14191044T 
77 77,1-7 91.111111a 	 yrksr ere f44 	Trl-d7 f4Err wrEr 9;PR.  wa- 
9-f 	9;rtv 	 thr, qici< 7 77 if•70 0 07 wrw*rtr wrEcRi 

ftivei 7* Tun' et : 

SfraWCE1 tit kf 27t8f17 i 	eft gr.449.  8117 rY f011 71471 
74 7'T fT uTi7T 4, ErErthea.  77, 071, 	419274 40 	414 

f471431E7 Tilt et 03 TR 25 Sffk1717 awff Efl mcwIT 	379"-t4- 
74W 314.7 478,7 9' T7 f4Err thr : 

srfavtr ZitWYt War WM-17 	0710 4, 0 7117fofilff fTiT 71131if 
T7, 	grtha.  Err srEEr 441iY feilt fa-4mm.  Trfirr jfri4E•u if g4=or1srfa.- 
4;EITMT 910 0 u€18170 qil ufU?Tf77 'TT 511E17 77 1370 t I" 

4-117 Nftifyiu9 0 UM 20 ,Iquitr (2) fyitnivr 41-  Alqint I  

"gr-ka-rq 44" ve 4-th 41.  4 qxrir 	prm cr-‹ Inc "wq*pr 411" 	f44 7rifir • 

6-119 vrfErf44.4 er UM 2317, 9-1174 TENT 9;41)7 ZITART (1) if, Wrgg "sre,31'q 

Erin, we wth 4.1 4 vrir 	* 704 ER wrei-q "weerfr 44" rer 	witir 

7—Tf7ufvF7413  ETM 28* 41,47rrr1TTRT 487 Wait 07 014 4.  
writ Er* 	,311446lt TrZirra:.— 

" 2 8-W--( 1) 'qt kfft ni 	Ma Tr, 94tit10 fglitEr * k Trfirerfr uar 
f-a9;rwre.crrErsr R 11r'4d SIifmn4 q ErrIzrir 

Pum  Tr  R-rw 4 %re Err faER TqfrPTNTjj sr45m EffrErrr 
srfafiwr < 4  

'AM, 41111 TRW-4144RM ktf OTT 4174TaTq E1T3T 28 
kff 	'II It 	IN 707 nitilf‘cf 9[91•9 0 47 \INK 	i<i7 tTtL 

art 20 TT 
E311314 

UM 22 
3f10117 

TriT 23 
0111134 

TIM 28-T 
411141 7191 

5--‘7763117717 0 UM 224' (f.A.Fil 79.wr Cuiri etErrwWI 3194177 t) vrav 



3 

( 2) we .17r cfeRTIIT TK Ore 7T fk7T TT. 7iTATUT FETT 4if 	sresra. 7174wi 
wEr crr:rr wit(' wrl-czj witr (  	4TGEri , 44w9Atr ;FEr 	itirphir 

wrrar 7f4.  T-1 Tv cri 	i 197 wrIT 4)7T q--(4 9;r17 qt-d-R 4 744 4 0 
T-F9-  tr,,TT 	

 

	

ifigta 7TZT))TIT Ail 	910 T.1. 	FrPiT irfirf 7Tur, 
rnrTh4 i 	d 	Yid 4 9214T 	Q41 T#7 * ;Tva; 7 IT 77rr: ffiww 
Froi I tuf 	qT 41' silo 	uid 	(Jai, 3:1fft 	qg 17I7 tfl3771.  
T.FT Wt.wrirrtur i vier-47 wi•Err I 

wfarrwErET 	arci 49 if ,-- 

(W) TTErru ( ) # 4IceW e4 	SPRY() 	I 	a" j. 
"34.6-fteTT" 	frit wait, 	 • 
(W) writTITI ( 2) fiz, 7440)7 	"4133 Atli -I er, 1898W 4ii 

1 4" * FZIT7 97 VITT, TIT 7T "Tiff TrT71 I1rfr, 1 973 * Jaq 14 12 wfi  
‘4 	!Lilt' 

9--9,9.  921N-ft-Ng W1 ErITT 53if ‘TETEITa ( 1) ir 7,17 1141.4 4-4Tt obTh-rtr 
f,11,1 trK 	";3-4 f4trWw" 	Waif 

I 0 	97 7fErf;14 +-I W-1 UM 54 4,-- 

(T) 7ro- 9217 	Alq11 #F07, 1898" *TTff ECK 714 TeR 9at 
"474 WfW4T ifficir, 1973" W f44 ‘311•:(11; 

(q) srfair-ETWIT 4144 ET, 7E4 9;r17 9;rT ``E.TRI 62 MAIM 65" 
ER 7E4 3;15fT Wh "471 62, UM 64-W 41 ETRT 65" W WI A 	RR 

1 	TrairlA *" 'air 55 % 	 ER Itti-.i1rnRci urn W tiwrcrift, 

"s s--urn 60 Tnr 3711TKT ( 2) 6TKI 62 ;217 ITT<T 64-9T % sitff 
WFWErErWI (fEr qi1U9:1741Htti 	411T !=irxicil 	973* TIT4i445.  

, 	WI-ATI-Reg q'ffr. 	iiiciThEr 	1" • 

12-4W 	 ErRi 60 *TErrff crK fw; 	ETRT W 4.177r4fi", 

" 60-- ( 1) ft06644 Ur 4f4t-H44-1 TT 41 TERI 4tT1*  	fohti 
Oa 'ANid, fiLild, f-Hoi Err 144 Ere fkit 9;TriE1 	WWW‘ 3:111-17 ATV 

crfiro, fffifrtrr, WfT, N-4nr cili, crtfgre41 rrff 	.11 (;-- 
fa-TEr  	f9-4 
vrft 

(w) ltti 	wfWth4iw i wqrcc,fkqärr ErftaF, 

	

 	„. 	 
111 31:41 9491 ts,4 ff.tc1I41 

(W) 414 (tr 	t èft orator t, 41 

(#) #i# (4if44 keT-€47) 	1-*-41 	Imr cc krtiz Err foul, 
179.4 	4-1-4-f Atm 191-4a. fv41 i zrt-dr- zrr 

	

aferitriril Err TRTITrath Vega-  tccir Eff aclizi 	ETT 

(V)  14'41  31.1-C WI *It ffrgT9-) wr,, 9;r1Alt zri \slit tul 
FITW fttil Errww 	tti * 19-41ur *fer tqa.  qi to I e Err wrtr4 EMT Err '444 w4 
4 4Acii t, ITT 

N) ¶ffWfErf-ffEr4 i" ;MN" 974‘,1 Ar7r, fErrfErff Err a-r7, 
z149 	m 1iusllII,# 	417w #9 0,eitif 3, Err 

(U) NW:1*W 1441 vr## ita# 4 RT-k <di 3, Err 

N) lira sr !if 094rticl qgfr i*-477 ftptil Trr-4-w 49 TT ici'4)4 etItqf 

tl ZIT  
	 , 

(U) ELM A2 * VEfiff vfiNitici alai 4 #T414u w-T4 ieTT 'am Er Mr 
ti ZIT f-4MTI ar 

49T1 
fryfrUff 

81-7T 53 TT 
€reruff 

4RT 54 TT 

aar £5 
q'T9" 	En• 

11T7T WT 3rfu-
“1797 

ETITT 60 
zyf T4 ER fftr 

4T7T WT AtU- 



am 6 3 
1111Ttaff 

ECM 64 
CCM.  EcR 
Errt 	gth- 
FEITa 

4 

311 WITT011' ciqErY IktIT 7TzlITT 0 0 qri 97 0 frWaT R17 5244112' faqir 
0017 71 UTZ (4) * TrEft6 WITTIV 	ffT114 	't 	3f ,Trq VIFT it 59711-41 

zrfa- 	4r4a 4.9 * 	u wifsrf444 w1 EW 5:rim 4974 44 14.40 
f44 T  mtvft * 3;r4,61T Err z43/4  3ZEirt# CiTc# 4744, aTf4tU crru 94rT 

044E0 
 

it mit 00 01 174014 7161, * 	Ili"' 4 WIT A 0Trr ert fa.41- 92-nr 
ffata. 4 tzurra-vait Tr9r a 	Eria 444 4, 0 0 4faa 0, 
WIT 6" 04r 

(2)0 Wit VT Taff6411T Trr ff*T11116 4914 6-4 fTifr 1646 Trr 	e 
CfrkTr 41 WIT Vf1114117 * 4614 Tca" N711 91144, 97-142: 41.  qT 	r uFifaq 
ErTa fa0 1117T WTI W1 f913114 w707 t, fa0 q711 WITITT17,16414 TT 917476 
W791 tifl311*1 4176 wt-r4 if WI t 	W177914 Wr, 71 0: 671 4 WA ff‘l 
9:11T 41 016 94.  6W 71 ITW61 4, 4,m fru 71461 41T g4-cg 4t ram WT1TM 
tt 7W1T 644 4 WT1 ffti' 	wIT 	414 W'T-T we 9* 71 1TWT1 4 I" 

ta—rriq 	itEJ1V 614 (fitiq ‘itit 	I TPT4 9114,41 	TenTr64 t) 
91-C umrk e,o -4" V 91 aim e,*11191697 	".:t.h1t1" 	fk4T q1711TT I 

14-114 141lif6614*1 ElITT 62 * 1414 q ul1ic11cf M7T W it Ym& 
ERTIfq:— 

"62-0 at& fat tql.  ffsrE 0, 0 aq 474 4 veil al a) m 
ct fnit 	Ind 0 at t,maa  wiThr *044 collar t Err .0114 %-r 

WTI will)1* 5r4111 wtii 	iiTos;r it Q61f-cfa.  ftsie 1.(6014 4144 
91/7 94r4* 	za4.14* 074 .11'41-  Trzh.  Trr f0r* Trgamr u4 rer eTzr 
fer vegr 	49-r4 0 at& srirrE Prim 44r e,   *19-4 u: 

	

MIT 	*IT 4q1; 	Tr'r( 	tha 	aa Trwact t, =to ticfrfr 

	

4Eq lam ,614613tR 	Tr441:w 4 0 	Ma q‘iiit 444 9* it iTWaT 4, 
allg614 ilEir 

k-,4 LG. 44 	 741W4RT 47 TrItTRuTT 	vl I 3110 fi T)1 fi-AZ in* 

art 4 	'Pao Ai4 fa. -;;;-,7 r-t-fft ma-r cal,' 	ma a, 	 ?EWE 7 Tr 
,n.14.  fan ft-xe 	zrr n.  fan RAG # 9ca-rg a  in 

15--1:14 #thrrpier it WU 63 4, wrta "016 	* F1116 TT 9,49 "cT 	; 3;r'R 

vta-  "4w nre * TWA 97 WET "TN' 7WTT" w fü 6144 I 

16--116' VW-TT* it URI 64* FM6W frti-ir9-p-47 um wit 	nrft, TrTrk:- 

"64--wl WY& Wf1 1;1f0f4zT6 * 12E,16 NIT MT' 14161 413-94, 4,141 Tri 4RT 
M1-4130171 Err 0 arta 0&' 	urza * 4aritM9-  4 eck' 5g, er7 

411* kaa gra ,,lecta 0( 4 4,14F-- 
a-f644 wrzif 
&tii vrrfgr 

(W) 	ft iqcpiCt wftrUwi 04 qT.4 ER tfi ft/41 5.51 9:17:4 a#N# 
at 	ti 4t4 04 ER, q-4iit irt44*F9-4 4;4* 	4 rfirtKr 0,.461 

	

 	ERnizzIT TRT giT10" 971 efiti I a, 41 

(ti) v11941'1, 0fTrz m crr6 it fait vral r,t,c,iaa WKW‘ 41917 
(rm 	zrr 04,114 t 	r 4 ititi*' 1174176/ n Rfafrigif 4 it;441  

utra-isr 	ZIT 

	

(4)   fm* U9 am sow ..imaru 4., 4 f•Tiq faM 4r44 4 
mu 40* RT/TA cir04 114 fwer 19.41:1.  ¶1 04(2" %.7 3SEfff cht,ciT 

srgt-a (r4 	tar a fffir 4*-T1T3, 11 it in wet ff.T 711TWM t, fwr 
\mit, a I,, 

 

d %RI 6 44 
flfT 

111-41 

7--4V Qiitfmr4 grKT 64*9t1lc 	fl44kfki 17R14J ci rr'idt, 9;10q:-- 
"64-W—(1)fir Oi 94f1irwrii titan 14101 TTI7T 	*fl-WT 111 

GINN* fkclWitf ER 	ten trk iir„41q4 arT** 49T6146 4g44 sacu 
 	17 ala 	irr4 gru 	a-r fffiTra.  ffr4-* w+-1 ert 

cni 	litrwm at& nititi era.  Cita.  46.61 iltc114a0 qj 
1"1"1! vrt4rfcra.  Taia-m zrr efror aqk 4ntram 0, zir ca.  gra-

tufa * fffa fq4;4* 9409.  9m4 44 fa0 fa44 irc fafa4it Grarzi 
ihiftcr 169141 a zn.  retool it Trvt ttr ai 	*QM friqur 
*Rear M12 ecdT it Inv 272 4 zrthff isitif4trar 	Witra ii fl r. 



4. 117-aft, 4.4 qiikicoo wt.  Pa.  093: ITT1T 4 Tri 	fr(17 41814 ati 5--f 
. 

	

	0, :i•on 0, 0 017 	TIT 8qi 
• 	

921-(tk-NAR ff* 
frfffT 4, MT v084(1 I 

• 
(2)A.  T-)1 41T Xrfilf9-411 gth-if FT* ITRT Tel * F4-74 0-1f4rdaT * 
wriihrumw 0457 rrr Errr-g*' 	4 to gq 1;41 4rPr wTrq 

filo; a-2 	A1111 Pn.  44 fam ry 	u ftrgaq 
t 	TIM * 4 1114 Wial to rivirtir TEM 41 glfirff W78T 
t, 	cwictiff TIM 	918' 	w 	4-far t, 941-c 9rrt 4179. 4.1d 4-R 
444 av 4%-ar t f4.41. 	: 

srFamr zrq kw! 	(g wzr 04r:— 

(vi) 5r4w gotta.* f97trzmr q  	741 
tr44-07, 

(41) sm-rffrati. err 9441 WI MU 	.* fert irro.  TTRNTT 
414.  91474 wr 	Ym 1" 

18-18.  tif1Tr-481:10 8171 69 * E0T9' 117 	tg1,9711 112 0 ,311‘1411; ;Ma:: 

"69--0ft et;) affer ETTU 60, ETRT 62, ETTKT 6301 EMT 65 *41#18 TT 
4s.17 Fez  *. Er r-c3A 	 404.  44 ki 4.44.-4.44 'p 

q"4414 ITIft 	tla *Nit cre RT44/IT esqttel 'TT 9:2Ti 
44"1 Mufl *cr0W8, 111i 	IA if Of Mt' UM T%  wart quS411.1 i ti& 
wer 	0-17 r0.9 T18*8-071-1 31E111, 617-q w4.179.  wr yru 4-r-4 4-r 
Irre 04r 41 yr mad-494 4.  TITEPPT 	44itiC0q 	K.-11-41 rth7T 311 
rr4s4r : 

si dart{ rrq fir EMT 60A' ‘i401 	1,1 (1), 81 AM 638T 11171 65% waftl 
an 	zrr ex-1447 Trgra *Nit 04.-for4 T5f ft4ra rrtf-Yra. 	wir 

91.82111T Tet 11TrET*chiticii0 TT YR.  141TT Atetor 	arrr 60 T1 ‘40iti (2) 
rrr um 62 * R111.8 fag VT 	 my 	 f9.4 04f4-14- 01.49R-1-  rrrr- 
qog e 4 	47 4 Wirt 	toclal *1)1(.1414 TT TT WIT idvi 

WM %I rieir0 t TEr 9-RT 044 4ra fT81 WItlq * 	f-Yr 
ITIR4gT8a2 WNW 	 1973* VSEMT 21* REM 11-Cifft attcn gait 
FTZIT qT frfaT t, 81T SMTL fi 	t ft-  it q.  r 	eqiq 	i oici41 

19-1-4 	rirvett RTLT 69-T 4,-- 

(w) 	 ( I) 4, viTc 9;11794-T "tTRT 
OF), 81118 (9) TIT Wrg (W) 0T UM 62" 

341TRT (1) *WM (8), Vin(tT), 
ETT WIT 62" IV M ,41:1;1; 

(q) 	 ( 2) 4, 	"1898 t o" 

20—r ti 	Furi80 tam 704, ‘Istols ( 4, RIM (T) 	•41W OK 01 
"RTIT 63" IT KRWtn, 	MT 4T017 "ART 63, gm 644" IT( M 

21—r SitSMI101171 71-T *WIRT< fie-Artoo artr t .o9.11-, wifra:- 

"71-w--qu4 srflizIT Sr, 1973 T1' EIRT 306 811-K 308 * •7T-4;11 
gm yr& 4 oaf 	1:194.  41 mulct 4v-e-41zr Ircrue 	fri-ciRT 4 3trff 
fierd 71-478 	it RPI 	SITTC 4 mu fitaTt ETRT 306 
IRitiri041 	* 4 	NKr 144 	* 4-4:Yrr wri: 	C e" 	 , 
1212t4 %oval' - 
WRItliCR 
arl &r.1 

w81.4 

60 *R118 k),9n.(Tr); IJ  
EiTH WC '0,75Z 	"MT 66 
(g) Tn (9) 0Twoutf (2) 

F0T8' 	WiT "1973" 'MUM 

grtT 69 * 
TzfT; 11-‹ qt 
817T 161 AFF-
8118 

Efill 69-T 
ci 41114.4.  

, 	. 

ART 70 ITT 
40181 



3TIT TZ71811:TTETT7TT qr 2.5tervi, 1.978 

22--T17 TTST it UM 74 *1TTEPT TR fa grol 
tr wpm% creq:- 

"74- ) 	511-a*Ttt 03*Tel at cif tau 11,74 1:11*TT MT MITT FTT 

srTrk-ra Err 4 anna fwn ;TER 0, fErfit wrqa fatrw 9iS, TRITR 

rrni4 	zrt TITTT ETTKT 34* Tal.9.  MfErd ITT ffferafffq 	ria trim 

ZR ftirit tii-cletf zftral47137-1.q f*33-41TRI 64 TIT ERT 68* gem' 

qt13.314 atruzr fwErr a, zrerrferra, 	fwtrqzrr faawr aa* zrr f-44 

srTmtr ruTra* wr 4 qta 	wit 4 aafEr*ErwrrirrSR rt wf-dr 

at( k'ir 441 linnet 4 faai itt aftrfaziff grEfra w•- 	ar4 aim wit azTrfu 

site TIM , 	
Try* (kir afErwres wrKr avarqu) Tlizr 

Tram fer at4 TR a 0-4* tr+-Fr t 

	

( 2) ft cti 	Pro MT, zIEITfelifff, k3111-4trfir ZR 	itT th-41.  TT TraT9.  

Eh-7 raw14 qt Tff 0441;tcr 	zftseta-m-r 	f-44,4nt ftErt Tarrr 	grit- 

liTrinntry 41-c 	Tri,' ft OE kir otictr;f4 Ca4 	ring 	el 

eft WIZI-41t FifFinel *f 	
nref TEO Tzigl.  I Erma wr 4 tilt 

Erwrfa FrIER 	4.)9qtr iram arzrar aatE fwik tft-Tricr 4 kir Tqftct 

Err aPirfa 47 fa% zer Taz? srfazir 4 a-lt arm w4410 	zft arer 

74-w- ( r) Erf4 Ter S attrafa4 4 fat- 
 timirerr, TrkfTre EITEI 

*7 EC* TTT 	TZ i *-11 *719ift amffir, Ten zrr irm 

vrthqr-srraqait 	 m1 zn Tit afErfaEnt atm rmzr4 f-dt faint 
zTaTra wwr a 0 Trw ET*1K grrr ferta srarwa 

arawrt afEtwO Etta aTat wit 4 ada* 41.  arfiRt rstrafTrff Er( aa-dr r 

(2) vcraltr (1)sn04 a-rfm artfTrff cot4 	*it grrbrr 	1441 

*TTTTIT 74 a* 1* tiMIET, ERNE ZIT clni ATI"W ZiT FIZR WeiWre .0— 

(T) 39' Ward fq-4 vr 	* TTE1.9.  wriar0 f•44 al* TT 

srgrra a, zireanKaikfafaa Waif k Trill 0; 

(ra) kir qv* ala, arrea 4 fara.RTE far ara, 	awn 

*raw facanTr flasarritz4 wrk wsfqatranraw k faErt natal; 

Erl'E 
(Tr) ant4 4 r41-& EFT zfqatiwr TrafR a.  fazrr azu 0 

(3) Ter& arna 
ftIT TR 3TIETTKT (1) * atfra TITTFRT TtgliTTff Ter 7Tzi 

afufwzr TrE44 f+-0 
Erma tnaTET 44fat0 TR afitzftraff4f fwa 

riM1 
23--.1WC 	931-4-*Ta (Si 	

TeTTITPT.'itz 1TITTITT) rufriLi et, 

1976 *1' UM 
2 if siqii amzr 19W ut< wiT "397 srtir Enciebta (tivilar)a ftoar, 

1972" * eTfTW TR 1TM' sr'R wiT "3W AT (TRTT-47 (1#11119) V1en1T, 1972" TEL 

	

71/1115;ftK.Trea ki 	Wit4 ‘77Tifil I 

24—TO ISIeTETTIT TTT KFITrzi 5fr Ws:Fria-fa fatfr vra.  “ta 4)', Si wilt ft 

TATTIT UKT '5 TT lettfizig sinrcrUzir  TIThiTTIT *Pit 	*11WET UM 28-* 

ata favE 	0-cr 	
4 avq1 Trzft a, fafFRETEr w yea* w TR 

aracqua-lt 37:4ITTT, *it 71TITT zrT fTer Val ‘I7( etTiff f*Err*TET,3-45'ETM 28-T 

*SfarEwrgiff:ErrafTrearafriff awrI, r" Firm ,414,11 Tn0 rafErfqtra* 

TWIT Trill Trry•F -9Trzt crT sria 4 I 

25-- (1)3-TCL sikTIT viTTRTra (9*.'553. ) ;TWA* 1978 iit< dtIt TRW 

Wart (fgaiEr *riga) ISIT711ZeT, 1978 q345171 fq-KfTra WT *TA.  t 

(2) 	fawa i 	carRr (i) 4 farm f-+* rsrurrker piti 

EpEr thrrifEra 	afaflaq S 	
*1 wit Err wrzerat 0:r fur,"4 4 gm  

trftrzra 	ErfaraTr 	nannq aTraTEN * %meta 	wi4 tit wk.-4re Rat 

mat TrrIN 	af4azrzr * waTEr Eca 9Trird RR-Er cm sria 

'tnat 
4TTflk WO, 

:tficc 

6 

ITM 74 * 
Tara.  TR 4t 
ant Err Aft-
FETTIT3 

11S 

1--d-K 	wig 
setTfwzrc ft5r11 
5, 1976 it 
ETTXT 2 TT 
4TITIETff 

4Eftrcerr 

fwf 
sTIVT4 



THE UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1978 

(U: P. Acr NO. 9 or 1978) 
: ['Authoritative English text of the Uttar Pradesh Abkari (Sanshodhan) 

Adhiniyanz, 1978; 

AN 
ACT 

further to amend the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910 
Jr is HER-EBY enacted in the Twenty-ninth Year of the Republic of India 

as follows :- 

1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) 
Act. 1978. 

S. For section 11 of the principal Act, the following section shall be 
substituted, namely :— 

"11. (1) The Collector, and every other Excise Officer (not being the 

Appeals 	and Excise Commissioner) shall, in respect of all proceedings 
revisIons. 

	

	under this Act, be subject to the control of the Excise 
Commissioner and all orders passed by Collector or such 

other officer under this Act, shall be appealable to the Excise Commis- 
sioner in the manner prescribed by rules made by the State Govern-
ment in this behalf: 

Provided that no appeal shall be entertained under this sub-section unless 
it is preferred by the aggrieved person within thirty days from the date of corn- 

. Munication of such order, and unless the appellant has furnished satisfactory 
. proof of having paid a sum of not less than 25 per cent of the disputed amount of 
:tax, fee, penalty or other dues, if any, as the case may be: 

11  • Provided further that the appellate authority may, for special and adequate 
reasons to be recorded in writing, waive or relax the requirements of the pre- 
ceding proviso in respect of such disputed amount of tax, fee, penalty or other 

, dues. 
; 	(2) The State Government may either suo motu or on an application by 
an aggrieved person call for and examine the records relating to any order 
passed in any proceedings under this Act, for the purposes of satisfying itself as 
to the correctness, legality or propriety of any such orders or as to the regularity 
âf adjai proceedings; and, if in any case it appears to the State Government that 
such order or proceedings should be modified, annulled, reversed or remitted 
for reconsideration, it may pass orders accordingly: 

,fr 	
Provided that no order adversely affecting any party shall be passed under 

I! this section unless he has been given a reasonable opportunity of making his 
representation : 

Provided further that no application under this sub-section shall be enter-
t'Aiped unless it is preferred within thirty days from the date of the order of the 
.Eitehe. Commissioner and unless an appeal, where it lies, has been filed and 
disposed of by the Excise Commissioner : 

Provided also that no application for revision shall be entertained unless 
the applicant has furnished satisfactory proof of having paid a sum of not less than 

25 per cent of the disputed amount of tax, fee, penalty or other dues, if 
any as the case may be : 	• 

*(For Statem:nt or objects and Reasons, please see Uttar Pradesh Gazette Extraordinary, ' dated April 5, 1978.) 
the (Passed in Hindi by the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Assembly on April 7, 1978 and by 

Uttar Pradesh Legislative Council on April 19. 1978.) 
' 	Received the assent of the Olvernort. on April 24, 1978 under Article 200, of the Constitution ofindia and vir-s Published in part I (a) of the Legislative Supplement of the ..1.11tat Pradesh Gazette Extraordinary dated Aril 25, 1978. 

Short title. 

2  2. in section 3 of the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910. hereinafter Amendment of 
referred to as the principal Act, clause (5) shall be omitted. 	 section 3 	of 

U. P. Act IV 
of 1910. 
Substitution of 

section 	11. 



Amendment of 
section 23. 

Amendment of 
section 22. 

Insertion of new 
section 28-A. 

Amendment of 
section 54. 

Amendment Of 
section 49. 

Substitution of 	11. For section 55 of the principal Act, the following section shall be :I  

new section for substituted, namely :— 
section 	55. 

Amendment of 
section 53. 

Substitution of 
new section for 
section 	60. 

5. In section 22 of the principal Act, including the marginal heading 
thereof for the words "eighteen years" wherever they occur the words "twenty• 
one years" shall be substituted. 

6. In section 23 of the principal Act, in the marginal heading and in 
sub-section (I) for the words "eighteen years" wherever they occur the words 
"twenty-one years" shall be substituted. 

7. After section 28 of the principal Act, the following section shall be 

inserted and be deemed always to have been inserted, namely :— 

"2S-A. (1) Where the quantity of spirit or beer in stock in a brewery 
Imposition of is found, on examination by such officer of the Excise 

additional duty Department as may be authorised by the Excise corn-
in certain cases, missioner in this 'behalf to exceed the quantity in 

hand as shown in the stock account, the brewery shall be liable to pay duty 
on such excess at the ordinary rates fixed under section 28. 

(2) Where the quantity of spirit or beer is found less than that shown 
in the stock account on such examination and deficiency exceeds ten 
per cent (allowance to that extent being made to cover losses due to 
evaporation, sullage and other contingencies within the brewery, and 
also to cover loss in bottling and storage), the Excise Commissioner shall 
levy an additional duty at the rate of one hundred per cent of ordinary 
rates of duty in respect of such deficit as exceeds ten per cent over and 
above the ordinary rates of duty." 

8. In section 49 of the principal Act,— 
in sub-section (1), for the words "an Officer-in-charge of a Police 

Station" the words "Sub-Inspector" shall be substituted; 

in sub-section (2) :  for the words and figures "Chapter XIV of the 
Code of Criminal Procedure, 1898" the words and figures "Chapter XII 
of the Cocte of Criminal Procedure, 1973" shall be substituted. 

9. In section 53 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words "an 
Officer in-charge of a Police Station" the words "Sub-Inspector" shall be 
substituted. 

10. In section 54 of the principal Act,— 

for the words and figures "Code of Criminal Procedure, 1898" the 
words and figures "Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973" shall be substRuted; 

in the proviso, for the words and figures "section 62 or section 65" 
the words and figures "section 62, section 64-A or section 65" shall be 
substituted. 

"55. All offences punishable under sub-section (2) of section 60. :. 

Certain offences 	
section 62 and section 64-A, shall be non-bailable within 

to be non- 	the meaning of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973." -, 
bailable. 

12. For 
section 60 of the principal Act, the following section shall be l 

utbstituted, namely :— 

"60 	
(1) Whoever, in contravention of this Act or of any rule or order 

Penaitv 	tor 	
made thereunder, or of any licence, permit or pass ' c 

unlawful import, 	obtained thereunder :— 

(a) imports, exports, transports or possesses any intoxicant other 

than chews ; or 

(b) cultivates any hemp plant (cannabio sativay; or 

export, 	trans- 
port, manufacture. 
Possession, sale 
etc. 

'2 

Provided also that the State Government may, for reasons, to be recorded 
in writing, waive, or relax the requirements of the preceding proviso in respect 
of such disputed amount of tax, fees, penalty or other dues." 

(2) shall be omitted. Amendment 
section 20. 

of 	4. In section 20 of the principal Act, sub-section 



3 

collects or sells any portion of the hemp plant (cannabis 
sativa) from which any intoxicating drug can be manufactured ; or 

(4) constructs or works any distillery, brewery or vintnery ; or 
uses, keeps or has in his possession any material, still, utensil, 

implement or apparatus, whatsoever, for the purpose of manufacturing 
any intoxicant other than tari ; or 

removes any intoxicant from any distillery, brewery, vintnery 
or warehouse licensed, established or continued under this Act; or 

bottles any liquor for the purposes of sale; or 
sells any intoxicant, save in the case provided for by section 61; 

or 
taps, or draws tan, from any tan-producing tree in the areas 

notified under section 42; 
shall be punished with imprisonment which may extend to two years 
and with fine which shall, in the case of an offence under clause (i) not 
be less than ten times the amount of duty which would have been levi-
able if such intoxicant had been dealt with in accordance with this Act 
and the rules and orders made thereunder or in accordance with any 
licence, permit or pass obtained thereunder, and in any other rasp,  not 
be less than ten times the amount of such duty, or five hundred rupees. 
whichever is greater. 

(2) Whoever in contravention of this Act or any rule or order made 
thereunder or of any licence, permit or pass, obtained under this Act, 
manufactures any intoxicant or imports, exports, transports or possesses 
any charas, shall be punished with imprisonment which shall not be 
less than six months and which may extend to three years and also with 
the which shall not be less than two thousand rupees and which may 
extend to five thousand rupees." 

15. In section 61 (including the marginal heading thereof) of the principal Amendment of 
Act, for the word "eighteen" wherever it occurs, the word "twenty-one" shall be section 61.  
rubstitutect _ . 

14. For section 62 of the principal Act, the following section shall be newSubsicttuitioonn for  
ituted, namely :— 

section 62. 
"62. Whoever renders or attempts to render fit for human consump- 

Penalty for ren- don any spirit, whether manufactured in India or not. 
deting denatured which has been denatured, or has in his possession any spint 	fit 

consump- 
fo 	denatured spirit which has been rendered fit for human human 	

r 
tion. 	 consumption or in respect of which any attempt has been 

made to render it so fit shall be punished with imprisonment for a term 
which shall not be less than six months and which may extend to three 
years, and shall also be liable to fine which may extend to five thousand 
rupees. 

Exyanation—For the purposes of this section, it shall be presumed 
that any spirit which is proved to contain any quantity of any denaturant. 
is, or contains or has been derived from denatured spirit." 

in section 63 of the principal Act, for the words "three months" the 
words "one year" and for the words "one thousand" the words "five thousand" 
shall be substituted. 

For section 64 of the principal Act, the following section shall be 
substituted, namely :— 

"64. Whoever, being the holder of a licence, permit or pass granted 
Penalty of cer- under this Act, or being in the employ M such holder 
tain acts by licen- and acting on his 	behalf See Or his Servant, 	 — 

fails to produce such licence, permit or pass on the demand of 
any Excise Officer or of any other person duly empowered • to make 
such demand; or 

wilfully does or omits to do, anything in breach of any of the 
conditions of the licence, permit or pass, not otherwise provided for 
in this Act ; or 

Amendment of 
section 63. 

Substitution of 
new section for 
section 64. 



4 

any rule made under section 40, 
(e) save in a easiP provided for by section 60, wilfully contravenes 

shall for each such offence, be punished with fine which may extend 
to two thousand rupees." 

Act, the following section shall be 17. After section 64 of the principal 
inserted, namely :— 

Whoever, being the holder of a licence for the sale or "64-.A. (1) 
adulteration etc. manufacture of any intoxicant under this Act or a person • Penalty 	

for in the employ of such holder, mixes or permits to be mixed 
by licencsed vendor with the intoxicant sold or manufactured by him any ; or manufacturer. 	noxious drug or any foreign ingredient likely to add to its 

actual or apparent intoxicating quality or strength, or any article prohi-
bited by any nde made under this Act, when such mixture does not amount 
to an offence of adulteration under section 272 of the Indian Penal Code, 
shall be punished with imprisonment for a term which shall not be len 
than six months and which may extend to three years and also with fine 
which shall not be less than one thousand rupees and which may extend 
to two thousand rupees. 

(2) Whoever, being the holder of a licence for the sale or manufacture: 
of any intoxicant under this Act, or a person in the employ of such holder 
sells or keeps or exposes for sale, as foreign liquor, liquor which he 
knows or has reason to believe to be country liquor, shall be punished with: 
imprisonment for a term which may extend to three years and with fine-
which may extend to two thousand rupees: 

Provided that the punishment shall not be less than— 
(i) imprisonment for three months and fine of two hundred rupees 

for the first offence, and 
(ii). imprisonment for six months and fine of five hundred rupees., 

for each of the second and subsequent offences." 

For section 69 of the principal Act, the following section shall hi; 
substituted, namely :— 

"69. If any person, after having been previously convicted of an offend 
punishable under section 60, section 62, section 63 or. 
section 65 or under the provisions of those sections as they 
stood from time to time subsequently commits and is cone 
victed of an offence punishable under any of these sections, 

he shall be liable to twice the punishment which may be imposed on a first 
conviction under this Act : 

Provided that in the case of conviction for a second or subsequent offence 
under sub-section (1) of section 60, section 63 or section 65 a sentence of impri• 
sonment for a term of not less than three months, with fine, and in the cas 
of conviction for a second or subsequent offence under sub-section (2) of section 7.; 
or section 62 a sentence of imprisonment for a term of not less than one year 
with fine, shall be passed: 

Provided further that nothing in this section shall prevent any offence tha 
might otherwise have been tried summarily under Chapter XXI of the Code of 
Criminal Procedure, 1973 from being so tried." 

In section 69-A of the principal Act,— 

in sub-section (1), for the words and figures "clause (b), clause (c)i 
clause (e), clause (f), or clause (h) of section 60, or section 62" the words: 
and figures "clause (b), clause (d) , clause (e) or clause (g) of sub-sec 
don (1) or of sub-section (2) of section 60 or of section 62" shall be 
substituted ; 

in sub-section (2) , for the figures "1898" the figures '1973" shall 
substituted. 

Amendment of 	20. /n section 70 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1) . in clause 	) 
section 

	

	70. for the word and figures "section 63", the words, figures and letter "section 63 
section 64-A," shall be substituted. 

Insertion of new 
section 64-A. 

Substitution of 
new section for 
section 59. 

Amendment of 
section 69-A. 

Enhanced punish-
ment after previous 
conviction. 



21. For section 71-A of the principal Act, the following section shall be Substitution of 
inbstituted, namely:— 	 new section for 

section 7I-A. 
"71-A. The provisions of sections 306 and 308 of the Code of Criminal 

Provisions regar- Procedure, 1973 shall apply in relation to offences puni-
ding pardan, etc. shable under this Act as they apply in relation to offences to apply to 

mentioned in section 306 of the said Code." offences 	under 
the Ad. 

22. For section 74 of the principal Act, the following sections shall be 
substituted, namely :— 

"74. (1) Any Excise Officer specially empowered by the State Govern- 
Compounding of 	ment in that behalf may accept from any person whose 
offences. 	licence, permit or pass is liable to be cancelled or suspended 

under section 34 or who is reasonably suspected of having 
committed an offence punishable under section 64 or section 68, a sum of 
money not exceeding five thousand rupees in lieu of such cancellation or 
suspension or by way of composition for the offence which may have been 
committed, as the case May be, and in all cases in which any property has 
been seized as liable to confiscation under this Act, may release the same 
on payment of the value thereof (as estimated by such officer) . 

(2) On the payment by such person of such sum of money or such 
value or both, as the case may be, such person, if in custody, shall be set 
at liberty, and all the property seized may be released and no proceeding 
shall be instituted or continued against such person in any criminal court. 
The acceptance of such sum of money by way of composition shall be 
deemed to amount to an acquittal and in no case shall any further 
proceedings be taken against such person or property with reerence to the 
same act. 

74-A. (I) If a holder of a licence, permit or pass granted under this 
Imposition Of 	Act or an employee of such holder contravenes any of the penality. conditions of the licence, permit or pass or any rule made 

under this Act, any Excise Officer authorised by the State Government in 
this behalf may impose a penalty not exceeding five thousand rupees. 

No order impoiing a penalty shall be made under sub-section (1) 
unless the holder of the licence, permit or pass or the employee con-
cerned is given— 

(a) a notice in Writing informing him of the grounds on which it is 
proposed to proceed under this section; 

(6) a reasonable opportunity of making a representation in writing, 
within such time as may be specified in the notice, against such 
grounds; and 

(c) a reasonable opportunity of being heard in the matter. 

No person on whom a penalty is imposed under sub-section (1) 
shall be liable to prosecution in respect of any offence under this Act on 
the same facts." 

Substitution  of 
new section for 
section 74. 

23. In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) (Re-enact- Amendment of 
mem and Validation) Act, 1976, in the opening sentence, for the words and U. p. Act no. 5 

section 2 of 
figures 46,79T 	W UT4TR.1 I ( TitErq ) Trftriff nit  1972" the words and 	of 1976. 
figures 463ffT givf 7Trrs7 (Usharq) strUf9lipl 1972" shall be substituted and 
be deemed always to have been substituted. 

21, Notwithstanding anything contained in the principal Act or any 
other law for the time being inforce, any levy imposed by the Excise Commis-
sioner, before the commencement of this Act, in respect of deficit quantity at the 
rate not exceeding the rate specified in section 28-A, as inserted in the principal 
Act by this Act, whether described as 'fine' or by any other name, shall be r!deemed to be 'Additional duty' validly imposed under the said section 28-A, 
as if the provisions of tins Act, were in force at all material times. 

Validation. 



	 *la crif trerdt r:17(e• 25%-s.-, 1978 
	

fl 

25. 	(I) The Uttar Pradesh .Excise (Amendmeni). Ordinance, 1978 and 	g 

the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Second Amendment) Ordinance, 1973 are hereby Onlitunes.  

repealed..  
DO. S ij 

(2) •Notwithstanding such appeal, anything done or any action taken LP' 

under the principal Act as amended by any of the Ordinances referred to in no. 6 
sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the cores- bye. 
ponding provisions of the principal Act as amended by this Act, as if the provi-
sions of this Act were in force at all material times. 

By Order, 
R. -C. DEO SHARMA. 

Sachiv. • 

;El 

'serval and 
satins.; 

-;ra 
citoltratiortio—qollo 34 30 (ftart') 25 i4-78--1078 —700 01'00 


	00000001
	00000002
	00000003
	00000004
	00000005
	00000006
	00000007
	00000008
	00000009
	00000010
	00000011
	00000012

